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A true story of death and survival in the world's most dangerous sport, cave diving. Two friends plunge 900
ft deep into a water-filled crater in the Kalahari Desert to raise the body of a diver who had perished there a
decade before. Only one returns. Unquenchable heroism and complex human relationships amid the perils of
extreme sport. On New Year's Day, 2005, David Shaw travelled halfway around the world on a journey that
took him to the Kalahari Desert of South Africa, to a site known locally as Boesmansgat: Bushman's Hole.
His destination was nearly 900 feet below the surface. On 8 January, he stepped into the water. He wore and
carried on him some of the most advanced diving equipment ever developed. Mounted to a helmet on his
head was a video camera. David Shaw was about to attempt what had never been done before, and he wanted
the world to see. He descended. About fifteen feet below the surface was a fissure in the dolomite bottom of
the basin, barely wide enough to admit him and his equipment and the aluminum tanks slung under his
shoulders. He slipped through the opening, and disappeared from sight, leaving behind the world of light and
life. Then, a second diver descended through the same crack in the stone. This was Don Shirley, Shaw's
friend and frequent dive partner, one of the few people in the world qualified to follow where Shaw was
about to go. In the community of extreme diving, Don Shirley was a master among masters. Twenty-five
minutes later, one of the men was dead. The other was in mortal peril, and would spend the next 10 hours
struggling to survive, existing literally from breath to breath. What happened that day at Bushman's Hole is
the stuff of nightmarish drama, juxtaposing classic elements of suspense with an extreme environment
beyond most people's comprehension. But it's also a compelling human story of friendship, heroism,
unswerving ambition and of coming to terms with loss and tragedy.
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From reader reviews:

William Stewart:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. As we know
that book is very important for all of us. The book Raising the Dead: A True Story of Death and Survival
was making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It is very
advantages for you. The book Raising the Dead: A True Story of Death and Survival is not only giving you
considerably more new information but also being your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your
personal spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship using the book Raising the Dead: A True
Story of Death and Survival. You never sense lose out for everything if you read some books.

Ryan Fox:

Do you one among people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on
guys that aren't like that. This Raising the Dead: A True Story of Death and Survival book is readable simply
by you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable reading
through experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer
associated with Raising the Dead: A True Story of Death and Survival content conveys objective easily to
understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the written content but it just
different by means of it. So , do you still thinking Raising the Dead: A True Story of Death and Survival is
not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Mellisa Holden:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the name Raising the Dead:
A True Story of Death and Survival suitable to you? Often the book was written by renowned writer in this
era. The book untitled Raising the Dead: A True Story of Death and Survivalis the main one of several books
which everyone read now. This particular book was inspired many men and women in the world. When you
read this publication you will enter the new shape that you ever know previous to. The author explained their
strategy in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this reserve. This
book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the
world within this book.

Kimberly Casselman:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our understanding for everything. By a reserve we can
know everything we want. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year
was exactly added. This publication Raising the Dead: A True Story of Death and Survival was filled with
regards to science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence.
Some people has several feel when they reading any book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you
can sense enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book that you
simply wanted.



Download and Read Online Raising the Dead: A True Story of
Death and Survival Phillip Finch #J5A0B81647S



Read Raising the Dead: A True Story of Death and Survival by
Phillip Finch for online ebook

Raising the Dead: A True Story of Death and Survival by Phillip Finch Free PDF d0wnl0ad, audio books,
books to read, good books to read, cheap books, good books, online books, books online, book reviews epub,
read books online, books to read online, online library, greatbooks to read, PDF best books to read, top books
to read Raising the Dead: A True Story of Death and Survival by Phillip Finch books to read online.

Online Raising the Dead: A True Story of Death and Survival by Phillip Finch ebook
PDF download

Raising the Dead: A True Story of Death and Survival by Phillip Finch Doc

Raising the Dead: A True Story of Death and Survival by Phillip Finch Mobipocket

Raising the Dead: A True Story of Death and Survival by Phillip Finch EPub


