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The worst drought in living memory grips the Rift Valley of East Africa. At the height the subsequent
famine, Chemone, a young Pokot girl, and her lover, Akur, flee from Apo, the man who has purchased her
from her father to be his new bride. Far from home they run low on food and more importantly, water. Akur
proves to be treacherous, deserting Chemone in the wilderness far from their tribal territory. Just before she
succumbs to a lack of water, Chemone is rescued by Lokwa, a young warrior from the Turkana tribe. Lokwa
nurses Chemone back to health and she comes to love her rescuer, eventually marrying him. She quickly
settles into a new life in Lokwa’s village deep in Turkana territory. However, Apo, the man who has paid her
bride price, is wealthy and influential. Chemone belongs to him, and he wants her back. He believes she is
hiding from him in Turkana territory. He hires young Pokot warriors to seek out Chemone. It's merely a
matter of time before they find her and drag her back to Apo. She's not sure she'll survive her return.
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From reader reviews:

Rita Campanelli:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the book entitled Children of the Rift: Chemone. Try to make the book
Children of the Rift: Chemone as your close friend. It means that it can for being your friend when you
experience alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned for
you. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , let me
make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Jorge Wilson:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a publication will give you a lot of new
info. When you read a e-book you will get new information since book is one of several ways to share the
information as well as their idea. Second, examining a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you
looking at a book especially fiction book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the character
types do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to others. When you read this Children of
the Rift: Chemone, you may tells your family, friends along with soon about yours publication. Your
knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a e-book.

Anita Rhodes:

The publication with title Children of the Rift: Chemone contains a lot of information that you can find out
it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This book exist new understanding the information that
exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to
understand how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you in new era of the the positive effect.
You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Sheila Kilburn:

The book untitled Children of the Rift: Chemone contain a lot of information on the item. The writer
explains your girlfriend idea with easy technique. The language is very straightforward all the people, so do
definitely not worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was published by famous author. The author
will bring you in the new period of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can please
read on your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book with anywhere and anytime. If you want to
buy the e-book, you can open up their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice go through.
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