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The true story of Captain James Riley and his crew of ten men, who were shipwrecked off the coast of West
Africa in 1815. Captured by locals, they are enslaved and suffer years of abuse and intolerable hardships.

Based on the journal of James Riley; wrecked with his crew off the coast of Africa, enslaved and seeking
redemption in the desert.

"Whilst rummaging about in an antiquarian bookshop some years ago, I found on the floor the Narrative of
Captain James Riley. As I flicked through the pages, I saw enough to be drawn by this true story of a man
and his crew going to sea, being shipwrecked, suffering enslavement and then encountering the desert, sand-
storm, battle, murder and imprisonment; followed by escape and further perils.
"Riley’s Narrative was an amazing tale, but just as intriguing were the parts of the story that were silent – his
origins, family, the details and histories of the places he passed through; and, vitally, what became of all the
characters after Riley’s account ended.
"After two years of research and the re-tracing of Riley’s footsteps in Morocco and the Sahara, I managed to
enlarge the story, not only by describing and explaining all connected matters, but also by tracing the lives of
the main characters up to their deaths; and ultimately suggesting the huge impact the story had on world
history.
"I hope that the result is a book that will captivate anyone who is interested in history, religion, fascinating
facts, heroism, adventure – or just a good read."

This fascinating story is thought to be directly responsible for the abolition of the Slave Trade.

Also by the author: Assassination - the Royal Family's 1000 Year Curse. (ASIN: B009G1SQ9G ). Murder,
Conspiracy and Treason throughout the ages. The utterly villianous history of Britain told around a series of
Royal murders and attempts.
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From reader reviews:

Donald Jones:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice
simply by surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated this for a while is
reading. That's why, by reading a e-book your ability to survive improve then having chance to endure than
other is high. In your case who want to start reading any book, we give you this White Slave book as
beginner and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

George Pinard:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the subject White Slave
suitable to you? The book was written by well-known writer in this era. The particular book untitled White
Slaveis one of several books which everyone read now. This book was inspired many men and women in the
world. When you read this book you will enter the new shape that you ever know ahead of. The author
explained their idea in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to know the core of this book. This
book will give you a lot of information about this world now. To help you see the represented of the world
on this book.

Katherine Shadrick:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching
TV, or maybe playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity that is look different
you can read the book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent all day
long to reading a e-book. The book White Slave it is very good to read. There are a lot of people that
recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. If you did not have enough space to
deliver this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book through your smart phone.
The price is not to cover but this book offers high quality.

Heather Delph:

Beside that White Slave in your phone, it might give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or
info. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh from your oven so don't become worry if
you feel like an previous people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have White Slave because this book
offers for you readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you do not get what it's exactly about.
Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be
questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss that? Find this book along with
read it from currently!
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