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From Library Journal The unique surrealist painter/sculptor/designer Dorothea Tanning (b. 1910) well
deserves this sumptuous volume. Her innovative oeuvre is lyrically evoked and reviewed by French critic,
playwright, and poet Bailly. For clarity, however, Tanning's own afterword and the comprehensive
chronology should be read before the critical essays. Some 214 color plates, four color foldouts, and 191
black-and-white illustrations mark out the visions of a fertile art not well known to the public at large.
American-born but for many years a resident of France, Tanning was eclipsed by her famous artist husband,
Max Ernst. Following paintings in the manner of Ernst and Balthus, she arrived at a singular style that
dissolves Surrealist fragments of eroticized bodies into a cosmic surge of life. Her soft sculptures of the
1970s are another revelation. She now lives and works in New York. Highly recommended for large
collections and those specializing in modernism. Mary Hamel-Schwulst, Towson State Univ., Md. Copyright
1996 Reed Business Information, Inc.
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer Wetzel:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information presently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even restricted. What people must be
consider while those information which is in the former life are hard to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one works to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you receive the
unstable resource then you understand it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you.
All those possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Dorothea Tanning as your daily resource
information.

Mary Abrams:

This Dorothea Tanning is fresh way for you who has attention to look for some information since it relief
your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know otherwise you
who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this Dorothea Tanning can be the light food to suit your
needs because the information inside this book is easy to get through anyone. These books develop itself in
the form that is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in
reserve form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So there is no in reading a reserve
especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you actually. So , don't miss the
idea! Just read this e-book type for your better life and also knowledge.

Lettie Perez:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-
book technique, more simple and reachable. This Dorothea Tanning can give you a lot of pals because by
you checking out this one book you have issue that they don't and make you more like an interesting person.
That book can be one of a step for you to get success. This publication offer you information that probably
your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than additional make you to be great people. So , why hesitate?
Let's have Dorothea Tanning.

Richard Oneal:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is composed or printed or descriptive from each source that will filled update
of news. On this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From
media social similar to newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
looking for the Dorothea Tanning when you desired it?
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