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The time of the judges were turbulent days in Israel’s history, marked by a continuing cycle of sin,
oppression, repentance, and deliverance. In time, the people decided they would do better under the
leadership of a king, and they arrogantly demanded that God provide them with one. Samuel, God’s anointed
prophet, warned they would be getting more than they bargained for—taxes, military service, wars, and
oppression—but they continued to insist. The Lord finally provided a king in the person of Saul, and
Samuel’s warnings came to pass.

 

In this study, John MacArthur guides readers through an in-depth look at this historical period beginning
with the miraculous birth of Samuel, continuing through Saul’s crowning as Israel’s first king, and
concluding with his tragic death. Studies include close-up examinations of Hannah, Eli, Saul, David, and
Jonathan, as well as careful considerations of doctrinal themes such as “Slaying a Giant” and “Respecting
God’s Anointed.”

 

The MacArthur Bible Studies provide intriguing examinations of the whole of Scripture. Each guide
incorporates extensive commentary, detailed observations on overriding themes, and probing questions to
help you study the Word of God with guidance from John MacArthur.
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From reader reviews:

Kenneth Tillman:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they are still students or this for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that question above. Every person has
distinct personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't want
do that. You must know how great and important the book 1 Samuel: The Lives of Samuel and Saul
(MacArthur Bible Studies). All type of book would you see on many methods. You can look for the internet
resources or other social media.

Kai Martin:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With examining you can
get a lot of information that may give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can
easily share their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their reader with
their story or maybe their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the guides. But also they write
about the information about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to
teach your young ones, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on this planet always
try to improve their ability in writing, they also doing some research before they write to their book. One of
them is this 1 Samuel: The Lives of Samuel and Saul (MacArthur Bible Studies).

John Keys:

Precisely why? Because this 1 Samuel: The Lives of Samuel and Saul (MacArthur Bible Studies) is an
unordinary book that the inside of the publication waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will jolt you
with the secret this inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who all write the book in such
remarkable way makes the content within easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the
meaning completely. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any longer or you going to
regret it. This phenomenal book will give you a lot of rewards than the other book have such as help
improving your expertise and your critical thinking method. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I
were being you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Robert Thomas:

Beside that 1 Samuel: The Lives of Samuel and Saul (MacArthur Bible Studies) in your phone, it could
possibly give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge
you may got here is fresh through the oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an aged people live in
narrow town. It is good thing to have 1 Samuel: The Lives of Samuel and Saul (MacArthur Bible Studies)
because this book offers for you readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you seldom get
what it's all about. Oh come on, that wil happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable set up here
cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss the idea? Find this



book and read it from at this point!
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