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Viking Identities is the first detailed archaeological study of Viking-Age Scandinavian-style female dress
items from England. Based on primary archival and archaeological research, including the analysis of
hundreds of recent metal-detector finds, it presents evidence for over 500 brooches and pendants worn by
women in the late ninth and tenth centuries. Jane F. Kershaw argues that these finds add an entirely new
dimension to the limited existing archaeological evidence for Scandinavian activity in the British Isles and
make possible a substantial reassessment of the Viking settlements.

Kershaw offers an interpretation of the significance of the jewellery in a broader, historical context. The
jewellery highlights locations of settlement not commonly associated with the Vikings. In contrast to claims
of high levels of cultural assimilation, the jewellery suggests that incoming groups maintained a distinct
Scandinavian identity which was sometimes appropriated by the indigenous population. Kershaw also
addresses one of the great unanswered questions in the study of Viking-Age settlements: what about the
women? The interpretation of the jewellery challenges traditional perceptions of Viking conquest as an all-
male affair and brings into focus a population group which has, until now, been almost invisible.

Kershaw describes the objects and explores a number of themes related to their contemporary use, including
their date, distribution, and function in costume. This body of material - unknown 30 years ago - is
introduced to a public audience for the first time. Including many object images and maps, the study provides
a practical guide to the identification of Scandinavian metalwork.
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From reader reviews:

Homer Smith:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for us to
know everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that book has different
type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They are reading whatever they
get because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Think about the person who don't like looking at a
book? Sometime, person feel need book when they found difficult problem or even exercise. Well, probably
you should have this Viking Identities: Scandinavian Jewellery in England (Medieval History and
Archaeology).

Kimberly Foley:

Do you among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on guys
this specific aren't like that. This Viking Identities: Scandinavian Jewellery in England (Medieval History
and Archaeology) book is readable by means of you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the info
here are arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge
that want to give to you. The writer associated with Viking Identities: Scandinavian Jewellery in England
(Medieval History and Archaeology) content conveys the idea easily to understand by lots of people. The
printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just different as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking
Viking Identities: Scandinavian Jewellery in England (Medieval History and Archaeology) is not loveable to
be your top collection reading book?

Sandra Leggett:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the name Viking Identities:
Scandinavian Jewellery in England (Medieval History and Archaeology) suitable to you? The actual book
was written by popular writer in this era. Typically the book untitled Viking Identities: Scandinavian
Jewellery in England (Medieval History and Archaeology)is the main one of several books in which
everyone read now. This particular book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this e-
book you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know before. The author explained their thought
in the simple way, consequently all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this guide. This book will
give you a large amount of information about this world now. So that you can see the represented of the
world in this particular book.

Norbert Walling:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Viking Identities: Scandinavian Jewellery in
England (Medieval History and Archaeology) was colorful and of course has pictures on there. As we know
that book Viking Identities: Scandinavian Jewellery in England (Medieval History and Archaeology) has
many kinds or variety. Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can



read and believe you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any
it can make you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like
reading in which.
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