
Iran and Nuclear Weapons: Protracted Conflict
and Proliferation (Routledge Global Security

Studies)
Saira Khan

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=0415845343
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=0415845343
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=0415845343


Iran and Nuclear Weapons: Protracted Conflict and
Proliferation (Routledge Global Security Studies)

Saira Khan

Iran and Nuclear Weapons: Protracted Conflict and Proliferation (Routledge Global Security Studies)
Saira Khan

This book investigates what is driving Iran's nuclear weapons programme in a less-hostile regional
environment, using a theory of protracted conflicts to explicate proliferation.

Iran’s nuclear weapons program has alarmed the international community since the 1990s, but has come to
the forefront of international security concerns since 2000. This book argues that Iran’s hostility with the
United States remains the major causal factor for its proliferation activities. With the US administration
pursuing aggressive foreign policies towards Iran since 2000, the latter’s security threat intensified. A society
that is split on many important domestic issues remained united on the issue of nuclear weapons acquisition
after the US war in Iraq. Consequently, Iran became determined in its drive to acquire nuclear weapons and
boldly announced its decision to enrich uranium, leaving the US in no doubt about its nuclear status.

This book underscores the importance of protracted conflicts in proliferation decisions, and underpinning
this is the assumption that non-proliferation may be achieved through the termination of intractable conflicts.
The aims of this work are to demonstrate that a state’s decision to acquire nuclear weapons depends largely
on its engagement in protracted conflicts, which shows not only that the presence of nuclear rivals intensifies
the nuclear ambition, but also that non-nuclear status of rival states can promote non-proliferation incentives
in conflicting states inclined to proliferate.

This study will be of great interest to students of Iran, Middle Eastern politics, nuclear proliferation and
international relations theory.

Saira Khan is a Research Associate in the McGill-University of Montreal Joint Research Group in
International Security (REGIS).
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From reader reviews:

Martha Robertson:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they're still students or the idea for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that issue above. Every person
has diverse personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't
want do that. You must know how great along with important the book Iran and Nuclear Weapons:
Protracted Conflict and Proliferation (Routledge Global Security Studies). All type of book could you see on
many resources. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Kevin Hamby:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold
on guys this kind of aren't like that. This Iran and Nuclear Weapons: Protracted Conflict and Proliferation
(Routledge Global Security Studies) book is readable by simply you who hate the perfect word style. You
will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable reading experience without leaving actually decrease the
knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer of Iran and Nuclear Weapons: Protracted Conflict and
Proliferation (Routledge Global Security Studies) content conveys thinking easily to understand by lots of
people. The printed and e-book are not different in the written content but it just different by means of it. So ,
do you still thinking Iran and Nuclear Weapons: Protracted Conflict and Proliferation (Routledge Global
Security Studies) is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Alexander Taylor:

Beside that Iran and Nuclear Weapons: Protracted Conflict and Proliferation (Routledge Global Security
Studies) in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or details. The
information and the knowledge you are going to got here is fresh from your oven so don't possibly be worry
if you feel like an older people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have Iran and Nuclear
Weapons: Protracted Conflict and Proliferation (Routledge Global Security Studies) because this book offers
to you personally readable information. Do you often have book but you would not get what it's exactly
about. Oh come on, that wil happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be
questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss this? Find this book along
with read it from now!

Keith Mayo:

That book can make you to feel relax. This particular book Iran and Nuclear Weapons: Protracted Conflict
and Proliferation (Routledge Global Security Studies) was colourful and of course has pictures on there. As
we know that book Iran and Nuclear Weapons: Protracted Conflict and Proliferation (Routledge Global
Security Studies) has many kinds or type. Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Private
investigator Conan you can read and believe you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book



tend to be make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book for
you personally and try to like reading that will.
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