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I have had four different careers throughout my life. During the third career, I worked with my wife, owning
and managing a gift and floral shop for twenty-five years. We managed to send our two kids through college
but realized that our retirement plans could not be part of this business. God was closing a door but opening a
window, as the old saying goes. My wife, Anne, joined me for the fourth and final career. We became senior
residential managers for the two Christian group homes owned by the Fredericksburg Baptist Church. One
home housed six ladies, and the other home next door housed six men. What a wonderful journey we had for
fourteen years. We were there when the seed was planted in the Special Friends Sunday school class and
helped nurture it to a reality when the first home opened in 1993. We learned so much from the residents
with their simple and strong faith. This was the most rewarding and enjoyable career that I could have
wanted. It wasn't a job; it was a wonderful experience and adventure!
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From reader reviews:

Vincent Cartagena:

Here thing why this particular How Far is it From Richmond to Heaven? are different and dependable to be
yours. First of all examining a book is good however it depends in the content of computer which is the
content is as tasty as food or not. How Far is it From Richmond to Heaven? giving you information deeper
and in different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no e-book that similar with How Far is
it From Richmond to Heaven?. It gives you thrill examining journey, its open up your current eyes about the
thing that will happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you. It is possible to bring
everywhere like in playground, café, or even in your method home by train. When you are having difficulties
in bringing the branded book maybe the form of How Far is it From Richmond to Heaven? in e-book can be
your option.

Jacqueline Morrison:

How Far is it From Richmond to Heaven? can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. We all
recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in
terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The author giving his/her
effort to put every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing How Far is it From Richmond to Heaven?
however doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource
information that maybe you can be among it. This great information could drawn you into new stage of
crucial imagining.

Robert Colgan:

This How Far is it From Richmond to Heaven? is great reserve for you because the content that is certainly
full of information for you who also always deal with world and also have to make decision every minute.
That book reveal it facts accurately using great plan word or we can state no rambling sentences inside it. So
if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward
sentences but hard core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having How Far is it From Richmond
to Heaven? in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that
no reserve that offer you world with ten or fifteen moment right but this publication already do that. So , this
really is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt that will?

Desiree Grajeda:

The book untitled How Far is it From Richmond to Heaven? contain a lot of information on the item. The
writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy means. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do
definitely not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was compiled by famous author. The author
provides you in the new period of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can read more your
smart phone, or product, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-
book, you can open up their official web-site and order it. Have a nice go through.
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