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One of the lesser known novels by Jules Verne, but certainly a novel that is worth reading, An Antarctic
Mystery or The Sphinx of the Ice Fields is a fictional travelogue that describes the narrator's adventures as he
travels from Kerguelen Islands, a group of islands in the Indian Ocean, towards the South Pole. Written as a
response and a sequel to Poe's The Narrative of Arthur Gordon Pym, this book will surely enchant readers
who are familiar with Poe's novel and love classic Jules Verne.The novel is the account of the journey made
by Jeorling, a rich American who has been studying the wildlife on Kerguelen Islands and is now looking for
a way to return to America. However, the journey cannot be that straight - the ship that Jeorling travels by
meets an iceberg with a dead body on it and they find a note indicating that some of the crew of the Jane,
Pym's ship might still be alive, so Jeorling and the crew of his ship go to find out if that is true. The journey
is, of course, full of adventures and mysteries, some of which get solved by the end of the book, while others
remain mysteries for good, to be solved by the reader's imagination.An Antarctic Mystery comes with all
features that make Verne so fascinating. The narrative is as detailed as any of the more famous Verne novels,
it unfolds in the typical rhythm and there are just as many detailed and scientific descriptions. The book
leaves a lot to the reader's fantasy, too - written in an age when not much was known about the South Pole
and many scientists still believed in the existence of an open sea beyond the ice barrier, this unknown
territory makes the perfect setting for a fictional travel book.
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From reader reviews:

Lee Rutledge:

The book An Antarctic Mystery or The Sphinx of the Ice Fields make one feel enjoy for your spare time.
You can use to make your capable more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting
anxiety or having big problem with your subject. If you can make reading a book An Antarctic Mystery or
The Sphinx of the Ice Fields for being your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your own
personal capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You can know everything if you like
available and read a publication An Antarctic Mystery or The Sphinx of the Ice Fields. Kinds of book are
several. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this
guide?

Johnny Harper:

The reserve with title An Antarctic Mystery or The Sphinx of the Ice Fields contains a lot of information that
you can study it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This book exist new knowledge the
information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u
to find out how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you inside new era of the glowbal
growth. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Dewey Rascon:

Reading a book being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to study a book. When you go
through a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your
knowledge, because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what
kinds of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your review, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, in addition to
soon. The An Antarctic Mystery or The Sphinx of the Ice Fields will give you new experience in examining
a book.

Beverly Bell:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book had been rare?
Why so many question for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people
likes reading through, not only science book but in addition novel and An Antarctic Mystery or The Sphinx
of the Ice Fields or maybe others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the truly
amazing a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or even
students especially. Those publications are helping them to bring their knowledge. In different case, beside
science publication, any other book likes An Antarctic Mystery or The Sphinx of the Ice Fields to make your
spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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