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The End of the Line tells the story of the 1988 closing of the Chrysler assembly plant in Kenosha, Wisconsin.
Kathryn Marie Dudley uses interviews with residents to chart the often confusing process of change that
deindustrialization forced on every corner of the community. This honest, moving portrait of one town's
radical shift from a manufacturing to a postindustrial economy will redefine the way Americans think about
our families, communities, and future.

"An excellent study not only of the cultural disruptions caused by the shutdown of Chrysler's operations in
Kenosha, Wisconsin, but also of the ideology of progress that abetted the shutdown."—Stephen Amberg,
Industrial and Labor Relations Review

"With the eye of an anthropologist, [Dudley] examines the tensions between the 'culture of hands' and the
'culture of mind.' Her account is especially instructive because, by many measures, Kenosha has successfully
recovered, yet for many the pain still remains."—Booklist

"Exceptional. . . . Should be widely read."—Douglas Harper, Contemporary Sociology

"Make[s] clear what a tenuous concept economic security is, especially when the rules for achieving security
are in flux."—Barbara Presley Noble, New York Times
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From reader reviews:

Tracy McCulloch:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students as they are still students or this for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
several personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
desire do that. You must know how great and important the book The End of the Line: Lost Jobs, New Lives
in Postindustrial America (Morality and Society Series). All type of book are you able to see on many
resources. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

John Enriquez:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold
on guys this particular aren't like that. This The End of the Line: Lost Jobs, New Lives in Postindustrial
America (Morality and Society Series) book is readable simply by you who hate the straight word style. You
will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable studying experience without leaving also decrease the
knowledge that want to offer to you. The writer connected with The End of the Line: Lost Jobs, New Lives
in Postindustrial America (Morality and Society Series) content conveys thinking easily to understand by lots
of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the information but it just different such as it. So , do
you continue to thinking The End of the Line: Lost Jobs, New Lives in Postindustrial America (Morality and
Society Series) is not loveable to be your top collection reading book?

Mary Andrade:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the subject The End of the
Line: Lost Jobs, New Lives in Postindustrial America (Morality and Society Series) suitable to you? The
actual book was written by famous writer in this era. Typically the book untitled The End of the Line: Lost
Jobs, New Lives in Postindustrial America (Morality and Society Series)is a single of several books this
everyone read now. This particular book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this
publication you will enter the new shape that you ever know before. The author explained their idea in the
simple way, therefore all of people can easily to understand the core of this guide. This book will give you a
great deal of information about this world now. To help you to see the represented of the world with this
book.

Catharine Rosol:

A lot of book has printed but it is different. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the most beneficial book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is
identified as of book The End of the Line: Lost Jobs, New Lives in Postindustrial America (Morality and
Society Series). You can include your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it might add your
knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most essential that, you must aware about publication. It
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