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Reclaiming Parkland details the failed attempt of Academy Award-winning actor Tom Hanks and producer
Gary Goetzman to make Vincent Bugliosi’s mammoth book about the Kennedy assassination, Reclaiming
History, into a miniseries. It exposes the questionable origins of Reclaiming History in a dubious mock trial
for cable television, in which Bugliosi played the role of an attorney prosecuting Lee Harvey Oswald for
murder, and how this formed the basis for the epic tome.

Author James DiEugenio details the myriad problems with Bugliosi’s book, and explores the cooperation of
the mainstream press in concealing many facts during the publicity campaign for the book and how this lack
of scrutiny led Hanks and Goetzman—cofounders of the production company Playtone—to purchase the
film rights. DiEugenio then shows how the film adapted from that book, entitled Parkland, does not resemble
Bugliosi’s book and examines why.

This book reveals the connections between Washington and Hollywood, as well as the CIA influence in the
film colony today. It includes an extended look at the little-known aspects of the lives and careers of
Bugliosi, Hanks, and Goetzman. Reclaiming Parkland sheds light on the Kennedy assassination, New
Hollywood, and the political influence on media in America.
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From reader reviews:

Tim Travers:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important behave,
like looking for your favorite publication and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can
add your knowledge by the guide entitled Reclaiming Parkland: Tom Hanks, Vincent Bugliosi, and the JFK
Assassination in the New Hollywood. Try to stumble through book Reclaiming Parkland: Tom Hanks,
Vincent Bugliosi, and the JFK Assassination in the New Hollywood as your buddy. It means that it can being
your friend when you really feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah,
it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you more confidence because you can know anything by the
book. So , let us make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Teresa Ealy:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always aim to and must have the extra time or they will get wide
range of stress from both everyday life and work. So , when we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity
do you have when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do
you ever try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the
particular book you have read is definitely Reclaiming Parkland: Tom Hanks, Vincent Bugliosi, and the JFK
Assassination in the New Hollywood.

Mildred Ralph:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind ability
or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book than can satisfy
your limited time to read it because this all time you only find guide that need more time to be read.
Reclaiming Parkland: Tom Hanks, Vincent Bugliosi, and the JFK Assassination in the New Hollywood can
be your answer as it can be read by you who have those short extra time problems.

Jennifer Knott:

Is it a person who having spare time after that spend it whole day through watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Reclaiming Parkland: Tom Hanks, Vincent
Bugliosi, and the JFK Assassination in the New Hollywood can be the respond to, oh how comes? A book
you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your time by reading in this new era is common not a nerd
activity. So what these books have than the others?
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