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At one time or another, perhaps you've thought, "In hindsight, ..." So, what happens when 'To have been'
becomes something that can be changed?

Charlotte Rhys Fenn is experiencing a mid-life crisis, one she’s been immersed in for a decade or more. A
once outgoing person, Charley has changed into an introverted and solitary soul, although she is married. In
fact, she and her husband, Michael are downright anti-social by society’s standards.

In 2025, a medical technology breakthrough, called Renovation, the modern-day fountain of youth, means a
redo of the past is possible and there is nothing Charley wants more than to experience a spark of light
through the grayness—a new career and an adventure that only cellular regression can promise.

Long since buried dreams would be within her grasp, yet, behind the fresh face of youth Charley will be the
same. It’s a difficult decision, one that could destroy all she has endeavored for, turning their life not only
upside down, but flipping it backward, forward, and inside out—for better or worse.

Learn more at: http://EllisonBlackburn.com/Regeneration-X/

Regeneration Chronicles reading order:
Book 1: Regeneration X
Book 2: Progeny
Book 3: After Effect
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From reader reviews:

Roberta Petty:

Now a day people that Living in the era where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each details they get. How many people to be
smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Examining a
book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Regeneration X (Regeneration
Chronicles #1) book because book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the data in this
book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Randall Blake:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new data. When
you read a publication you will get new information due to the fact book is one of several ways to share the
information as well as their idea. Second, examining a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you
reading through a book especially fiction book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the figures
do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other people. When you read this Regeneration X
(Regeneration Chronicles #1), you can tells your family, friends along with soon about yours book. Your
knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a publication.

Anna Chew:

Regeneration X (Regeneration Chronicles #1) can be one of your nice books that are good idea. Many of us
recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary which could increase your
knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information. The
copy writer giving his/her effort to place every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Regeneration X
(Regeneration Chronicles #1) nevertheless doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest as well
as based confirm resource info that maybe you can be one among it. This great information can drawn you
into brand new stage of crucial contemplating.

Jesica Simon:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book had been rare? Why so
many issue for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
reading, not only science book but additionally novel and Regeneration X (Regeneration Chronicles #1) or
perhaps others sources were given understanding for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel
need to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or even students especially. Those
books are helping them to increase their knowledge. In additional case, beside science e-book, any other
book likes Regeneration X (Regeneration Chronicles #1) to make your spare time much more colorful. Many
types of book like this one.
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