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There is a new kind of dad, and he’s doing far more domestic duty than at any time in history, including
cooking. Although it’s written with a sense of humor, this book is a serious resource for dads and anyone
else interested in upping their game to make great tasting food at home, even if they have never used a chef’s
knife or a roasting pan before.

Author Robert Rosenthal teaches basic techniques and presents a playbook of simple recipes that achieve the
most taste with the fewest ingredients and the least effort.™ The dishes are sophisticated enough for
entertaining, yet family table tested as well. Short Order Dad covers all the essentials, from shopping
ingredients and cooking tools to appetizers, soups and salads, snacks, entrees, sauces and dressings, sides,
desserts, cocktails and more, to make anyone a successful chef.

Good cooking doesn’t have to be complicated to be great. In fact, it’s just the opposite. So whether you’re
clueless in the kitchen, pan-fry phobic, or already a skilled cook, Short Order Dad is here to help turn your
kitchen into a place to play.

Skyhorse Publishing, along with our Good Books and Arcade imprints, is proud to publish a broad range of
cookbooks, including books on juicing, grilling, baking, frying, home brewing and winemaking, slow
cookers, and cast iron cooking. We’ve been successful with books on gluten-free cooking, vegetarian and
vegan cooking, paleo, raw foods, and more. Our list includes French cooking, Swedish cooking, Austrian
and German cooking, Cajun cooking, as well as books on jerky, canning and preserving, peanut butter,
meatballs, oil and vinegar, bone broth, and more. While not every title we publish becomes a New York
Times bestseller or a national bestseller, we are committed to books on subjects that are sometimes
overlooked and to authors whose work might not otherwise find a home.
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From reader reviews:

Leif Gibbs:

Now a day folks who Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not require people to be aware of each data they get. How individuals to be
smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Looking at a book can
help folks out of this uncertainty Information especially this Short Order Dad: One Guy’s Guide to Making
Food Fun and Hassle-Free book as this book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the data
in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Johnathan Fuller:

Exactly why? Because this Short Order Dad: One Guy’s Guide to Making Food Fun and Hassle-Free is an
unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will shock you with
the secret it inside. Reading this book alongside it was fantastic author who also write the book in such
amazing way makes the content interior easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the
meaning entirely. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This
amazing book will give you a lot of positive aspects than the other book have got such as help improving
your talent and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I were being
you I will go to the book store hurriedly.

Dana Register:

Short Order Dad: One Guy’s Guide to Making Food Fun and Hassle-Free can be one of your basic books
that are good idea. We all recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that may
increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the
information. The article writer giving his/her effort to put every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing
Short Order Dad: One Guy’s Guide to Making Food Fun and Hassle-Free although doesn't forget the main
place, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource details that maybe you can be one
among it. This great information can certainly drawn you into fresh stage of crucial imagining.

Louise Suttle:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you can have
it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. This kind of Short Order Dad: One Guy’s Guide to Making
Food Fun and Hassle-Free can give you a lot of close friends because by you looking at this one book you
have issue that they don't and make you more like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of a
step for you to get success. This reserve offer you information that probably your friend doesn't recognize,
by knowing more than different make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? We need to have Short
Order Dad: One Guy’s Guide to Making Food Fun and Hassle-Free.
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