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Edward and Meg are like night and day. How could such different people be twins? Well, they are, but they
don't have to like it -- or each other.For seventh grade, brainy Meg is attending ultra-competitive Fischer,
while freewheeling Edward goes to an alternative school downtown. But it's just when they're finally out of
each other's shadows that the trouble begins. Meg's aspirations for popularity and a boyfriend combine with
Edward's devious planning and lack of singing ability to set off a showdown the likes of which twindom has
never before seen. Why is this final showdown so much fun? Could it be that Meg and Edward are more
alike than they thought?
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From reader reviews:

Lawrence Elam:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Sure, you
can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a move,
shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open as well as read a book allowed [(Never Mind!: A Twin
Novel )] [Author: Avi] [May-2005]? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You recognize beside you can
spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with its opinion or
you have different opinion?

George Eichner:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information currently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider any time those information which is from the former life are challenging to be find than now is
taking seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you
receive the unstable resource then you have it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for
you. All of those possibilities will not happen with you if you take [(Never Mind!: A Twin Novel )] [Author:
Avi] [May-2005] as your daily resource information.

Gerald Allen:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside together with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by reading a book. Ugh, ya
think reading a book can really hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It alright you can have
the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like [(Never Mind!: A Twin Novel )]
[Author: Avi] [May-2005] which is getting the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.

Timothy Wrobel:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is composed or printed or highlighted from each source this filled update of news. On
this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media social
similar to newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
seeking the [(Never Mind!: A Twin Novel )] [Author: Avi] [May-2005] when you desired it?
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