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Fascinating insights into modern strategic management from an Islamic perspective

While strategic management is a cornerstone of any MBA program, it's almost always taught from
conventional theories and typically American case studies. This book takes those traditional theories and
interprets them from an Islamic perspective using more international case studies. Though primarily intended
as a textbook for business students, the book is also extremely useful for any Muslim business leaders who
want to transform their businesses while complying with Shariah, with a particular focus on developing
corporate cultures and structures in sync with Islamic values. Offers a critical review of conventional
strategic management theory, suggesting more effective alternatives based on a combination of conventional
and Islamic theories Includes international case studies, each with a particularly Islamic angle Written by a
successful author team that has written extensively on the subject of business management from an Islamic
perspective
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From reader reviews:

Karla Walker:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
data. When you read a guide you will get new information since book is one of a number of ways to share
the information as well as their idea. Second, reading a book will make you more imaginative. When you
reading through a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story
how the people do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to others. When you read this Strategic
Management from an Islamic Perspective: Text and Cases, you could tells your family, friends and soon
about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a reserve.

Wayne Gaddis:

The publication with title Strategic Management from an Islamic Perspective: Text and Cases posesses a lot
of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This book exist new
know-how the information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world now. That is
important to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you within new era
of the the positive effect. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere
you want.

Thomas Mitchell:

In this particular era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple solution to have that.
What you have to do is just spending your time little but quite enough to have a look at some books. Among
the books in the top collection in your reading list is actually Strategic Management from an Islamic
Perspective: Text and Cases. This book which can be qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in
getting precious person. By looking upward and review this publication you can get many advantages.

Nancy Stever:

E-book is one of source of information. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen require book to know the update information of year for you to year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world.
With the book Strategic Management from an Islamic Perspective: Text and Cases we can take more
advantage. Don't you to be creative people? To get creative person must prefer to read a book. Merely
choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life by this book
Strategic Management from an Islamic Perspective: Text and Cases. You can more pleasing than now.
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